
The Sacredness of Life  
and  

the Sin of Murder 

Murder is universally recognized as a grievous sin, but its roots and 
broader implications go much deeper than the act of taking a life. From a 
biblical perspective, murder is fundamentally wrong because it violates the 
sanctity of life, which is sacred because every human is made in the image 
of God (Genesis 1:26-27). Additionally, actions that devalue or harm 
others, even in minor ways, are akin to murdering a piece of their spirit.


The Image of God in Humanity 

(Read) Genesis 1:26-27 

The foundation for understanding why murder is wrong begins with the 
doctrine of Imago Dei, the belief that humans are created in the image of 
God. This truth establishes the inherent value and dignity of every person. 
Striking another person, whether physically, emotionally, or verbally, is an 
affront to God Himself.


(Read) James 3:9-10 


The book of James speaks to the inconsistency of praising God while 
cursing human beings made in His likeness.


Reflect on how recognizing the image of God in others influences your 
actions and attitudes toward them. Consider how this should cultivate a 
deep respect and love for others, leading to actions that honor God.




The Sixth Commandment: You Shall Not Murder 

(Read) Exodus 20:13 

The commandment against murder is more than a prohibition against 
physical killing; it encompasses any act that devalues human life. Jesus 
expanded on this in the Sermon on the Mount, equating anger and insults 
with murder (Matthew 5:21-22).


(Read) 1 John 3:15 

This verse equates hatred with murder, emphasizing the heart's condition 
rather than merely the outward act.


Examine your heart for anger, bitterness, or contempt toward others. 
Repent of these attitudes and seek reconciliation where needed, 
embodying the love and patience of Christ.


Gratitude and Self-Control as Virtues 

(Read) Colossians 3:12-15 

The call to put on virtues such as compassion, kindness, humility, 
gentleness, and patience is essential for maintaining harmony and 
honoring the image of God in others. Gratitude, mentioned in verse 15, 
fosters a heart that values and respects others.


(Read) Galatians 5:22-23 

This Verse listing the fruit of the Spirit, which includes self-control, a key 
virtue in preventing actions that harm others.


Cultivate gratitude and self-control through regular prayer, Scripture 
reading, and practical exercises such as journaling things you are thankful 
for. Reflect on how these virtues can transform your interactions with 
others.




The Broader Implications of Disrespect 

(Read) Romans 12:10-18 

Respect and love for one another are foundational to Christian community. 
Verses 10 and 18 specifically call believers to honor others above 
themselves and live at peace with everyone, which inherently rejects any 
form of devaluing or harming others.


(Read) Philippians 2:3-4  

This verse calls for humility and valuing others above oneself, countering 
the self-centeredness that often leads to disrespect and harm.


Practice humility and respect by actively listening to others, serving them, 
and considering their needs and perspectives. Challenge yourself to 
respond with grace and patience, even when it is difficult.


Practical Steps to Avoid "Murdering" Others Spiritually 

(Read) Ephesians 4:29-32 

Paul admonishes believers to avoid corrupting talk, bitterness, wrath, and 
anger, urging instead for kindness, tenderheartedness, and forgiveness. 
These instructions guide us in building up rather than tearing down others.


(Read) Proverbs 15:1 

This verse highlights the power of gentle words to diffuse anger and 
prevent harm.


Commit to speaking words that edify and build up others. Practice 
forgiveness and seek to resolve conflicts quickly and peacefully, striving to 
reflect Christ’s love in all interactions.


Understanding why murder is wrong from a biblical perspective involves 
recognizing the sacredness of life, the image of God in every person, and 
the broader implications of our actions and attitudes toward others. By 



cultivating gratitude, self-control, and respect, we honor God and His 
creation, reflecting His love and holiness in our lives.


The Role of Justice and the Importance of Being Led  
by God's Righteousness 

While the Bible unequivocally condemns murder, it also acknowledges that 
justice sometimes involves acts of violence, particularly when executed by 
God or ordained authorities. Understanding this balance is crucial for 
believers who seek to uphold justice and righteousness according to 
God's standards rather than their own.


Biblical Justice and Righteousness 

(Read) Micah 6:8 

The prophet Micah succinctly summarizes what God requires: to act justly, 
love mercy, and walk humbly with God. Justice and righteousness are 
foundational to God's character and His expectations for His people.


(Read) Psalm 89:14 

This verse states that righteousness and justice are the foundation of 
God's throne, highlighting their importance in His rule.


Reflect on how you can pursue justice and righteousness in your daily life. 
Seek ways to align your actions and decisions with God's standards.


The Role of Violence in Divine Justice 

(Read) Romans 13:1-4


Paul teaches that governing authorities are established by God and bear 
the sword to execute justice, which sometimes involves violence to punish 
wrongdoers. This authority is part of God's provision for maintaining order 
and justice in a fallen world.




(Read) Deuteronomy 32:35 

This is where God declares that vengeance and recompense belong to 
Him, indicating that divine justice can involve retribution.


Understand the distinction between personal vengeance and divinely 
ordained justice. Trust in God's sovereignty and the role of authorities in 
executing justice.


Examples of Violent Justice in Scripture 

(Read) Joshua 6:20-21 

The fall of Jericho is a vivid example of God commanding His people to 
execute violent judgment as part of His justice. This action, while severe, 
was part of God's righteous plan to establish His people in the Promised 
Land.


(Read) 1 Samuel 15:3 

This is where God commands Saul to utterly destroy the Amalekites, 
demonstrating that divine justice can involve the complete eradication of 
evil.


Consider the context and purpose behind instances of violent justice in 
Scripture. Reflect on how these examples reveal God's holiness and 
intolerance of sin.


The Dangers of Acting on Our Own Justice 

(Read) Romans 12:19 

Paul warns against taking vengeance into our own hands, emphasizing 
that vengeance belongs to God. Acting on our own sense of justice can 
lead to sin and further injustice.




(Read) Proverbs 20:22  

This verse advises against repaying evil with evil and encourages waiting 
for the Lord's deliverance.


Practice patience and trust in God's timing and methods for justice. Avoid 
the temptation to take matters into your own hands, which can lead to 
unrighteous actions.


Being Led by God's Righteousness 

(Read) Matthew 6:33 

Jesus teaches that seeking God's kingdom and righteousness should be 
our primary focus. When we prioritize God's standards, He will provide for 
our needs and guide us in all things.


(Read) Proverbs 3:5-6 

This verse encourages trusting in the Lord with all our heart and 
acknowledging Him in all our ways for His guidance.


Make seeking God's will and righteousness a daily priority. Regularly pray 
for guidance and wisdom, and immerse yourself in Scripture to understand 
His standards.


Balancing the understanding of murder's sinfulness with the recognition 
that justice sometimes involves violence requires a deep reliance on God's 
wisdom and guidance. We are called to uphold justice and righteousness 
according to God's standards, avoiding the pitfalls of personal vengeance 
and self-righteousness.


This expanded study provides a comprehensive view of why murder is 
wrong biblically, the role of justice, and the necessity of being led by God's 
righteousness. It encourages believers to live in a way that honors God, 
respects His image in others, and seeks His guidance in all things.




The Attitude Toward Others in Light of God's Image 

In our daily interactions, the way we treat others reflects our understanding 
of God's image in them and our commitment to His commands. This Bible 
study has shown that each person is made in the image of God, and 
therefore, every act of disrespect or harm, no matter how small, is an 
affront to God Himself. When we fail to practice gratitude, self-control, and 
love, we not only sin against God but also diminish the spirit of those 
around us.


However, it is crucial to recognize that the virtues of gratitude, self-control, 
and love are not merely products of our own efforts. They are fruits of the 
Spirit, given to us by God. Our ability to maintain these virtues reflects our 
desperate dependence on the Savior.


Recognize the Image of God in Everyone: 


Every person is made in the image of God (Genesis 1:26-27). Striking 
another, whether physically or emotionally, is akin to striking God. This 
truth demands that we treat others with the utmost respect and dignity.


The Command Against Murder:  

The commandment, "You shall not murder" (Exodus 20:13), extends 
beyond physical killing to include any actions that devalue human life. 
Jesus equated anger and contempt with murder (Matthew 5:21-22), 
emphasizing the importance of the heart's condition.


The Fruits of the Spirit:  

The virtues of compassion, kindness, patience, and self-control, 
highlighted in Galatians 5:22-23, are fruits of the Spirit. They are given to 
us by God and are evidence of the Holy Spirit's work in our lives.


Impact of Our Attitude on Others: 


Romans 12:10-18 calls us to honor and respect others, living at peace 
with everyone. Our attitude and actions can either build up or tear down 



those around us. Disrespect and impatience harm others and dishonor 
God.


The Role of Justice and God's Righteousness: 


Romans 13:1-4 and Proverbs 3:5-6 remind us that justice belongs to God 
and that we must seek His righteousness. Acting on our own sense of 
justice can lead to sin; therefore, we must trust in God's timing and 
methods.


Cultivate Gratitude 

Regularly reflect on and give thanks for the blessings in your life. Let 
gratitude shape your interactions, fostering a positive and loving attitude 
toward others. Recognize that this gratitude is a gift from God.


Practice Self-Control 

Be mindful of your words and actions, especially in challenging situations. 
Choose to respond with patience and kindness, reflecting Christ's love. 
Understand that true self-control is a fruit of the Spirit.


Respect and Build Up Others 

Make a conscious effort to honor and respect every person, recognizing 
the image of God in them. Seek to encourage and build up others, 
avoiding actions that harm or devalue them. Lean on the Holy Spirit to 
empower you to do this.


Trust in God's Justice 

Leave matters of justice and vengeance to God. Focus on living 
righteously and trusting in His sovereign plan, knowing that He will guide 
you in His justice and righteousness.


Every time you speak harshly or act disrespectfully toward another person, 
you are dishonoring the image of God in them. Each act of impatience or 



ingratitude is a small act of "murder," tearing down the spirit of those 
around you. Reflect deeply on the impact of your actions and attitudes. 
Ask yourself how you can better embody the love, respect, and self-
control that Christ exemplified, acknowledging your dependence on the 
Holy Spirit to cultivate these virtues.


By maintaining an attitude of gratitude and love, you not only honor God 
but also positively impact the lives of those around you. Let your actions 
be a testament to the transformative power of Christ's love, building up 
rather than tearing down, and reflecting the image of God in every 
interaction.


How does the doctrine of Imago Dei influence your view of others? 

In what ways can anger or contempt be seen as forms of "murder"? 

What practical steps can you take to cultivate gratitude and self-
control in your daily life? 

How can you demonstrate greater respect and love for those around 
you, especially in challenging situations? 

How do you reconcile the commandment against murder with 
instances of violent justice in the Bible? 

What steps can you take to ensure you are seeking God's justice and 
righteousness rather than relying on your own? 

How can you support and respect authorities that are tasked with 
executing justice?


